
Along with the need for 
more versatile public 
space down town, the 
history & location of the 
Witness Tree landing 
is advantageous to the 
project. Also, after the 
completion of Ernst and 
Young complex, the site 
will become a major cut-
through for locals and 
patrons alike.

Opportunity User Solution
The residents of the Ware-
house District are in need 
of a revitalization in their 
community. Upon the ar-
rival of industry in the 
1900’s, the majority of the 
district residents retreat-
ed for the quieter, cleaner 
suburbs.

A public space that is not 
only inviting to the public, 
but also has a strong 
underlying theme the 
carries through in bringing 
the community together, 
as well as educates the 
public on the cities unique 
heritage.  


